
DEFENDING THE PUBLIC SECTOR 
Resources for Advocates 

The following is a compilation of data and resources for advocates defending the public sector and the men and 

women who work in public service. 

Demographic Information on the Public Sector Workforce 

In 2013, the public sector accounted for 16 percent of all employment in the United States, down from a high of 19.2 
percent in 1975.1 Public sector employers include the federal government, state and local governments and school 
districts. Those who work in this sector include teachers, firefighters and nurses. Union membership among public sector 
employees is significant. The percentage of public sector employees with unions is 35.7 percent compared to 6.6 percent in 
the private sector.2  

State and local governments have historically provided more employment and advancement opportunities for women and 
Black workers in comparison with the private sector. Through legislation and the adoption of affirmative action and anti-
discrimination policies, the public sector exceeds the private sector in maintaining a commitment to a diverse workforce.3 
As a result, women constitute a disproportionately large share of the state and local workforce compared to the private 
sector (59.5 versus 46.7 percent). Similarly, Black Americans comprise a higher share of the state and local workforce 
compared to the private sector (12.8 versus 10.3 percent).4 The public sector has also been a source of higher paying jobs 
for Black employees; Black women in the public sector earned 25 percent more than Black women in the workforce as 
a whole.5 When the Great Recession and austerity measures caused state and local governments to shed 765,000 jobs, 
women and Black employees accounted for about 70 percent and 20 percent, respectively, of those losses.6  

Further Resources: 
Economic Policy Institute (www.epi.org) and UC Berkeley Labor Center (www.laborcenter.berkeley.edu)

Challenges to the Collective Bargaining Rights of Public Sector Employees

Men and women have the means to negotiate over the terms of their employment through collective bargaining. Federal 
law offers many federal employees the right to engage in collective bargaining over a limited set of issues, and state laws 
govern the right of state and local government employees to engage in collective bargaining.7 As of 2014, three states 
prohibit collective bargaining for all public sector employees.8 In June 2014, the Supreme Court ruled in Harris v. Quinn 
to significantly limit the collective bargaining rights of public sector child-care and home-care providers. Human Rights 
Watch considers the prohibition of bargaining in direct violation of international human rights law.9 

Currently, there is a major legal challenge facing working people employed in the public sector. Frederichs v. California 
Teachers Association is a case before the U.S. Supreme Court, brought by the Center for Individual Rights, a group with 
ties to extreme right-wing funders.10 A negative ruling would hamper the ability of people who serve the public to have a 
say over their wages, working conditions and how they protect our communities. 

Further Resources:
Center for Economic Policy Research (www.cepr.net), America Works Together (www.americaworkstogether.us)
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Contracting Out Threatens Public Accountability and Good Jobs

A continuous threat facing working people, taxpayers, and local communities is the growing trend of governments’ 
contracting with private firms to provide services they normally offer. Studies have shown that it actually ends up costing 
taxpayers more to contract out government services to for-profit firms than it does to have government employees 
continue to perform the work.11 Jobs that governments contract out tend to pay lower wages and benefits, siphoning 
money from local economies.12 Outsourcing to private corporations also removes public accountability and control over 
government services. With only three days of public input, the city of Chicago negotiated a deal with a private firm to run 
its parking meters – a deal that could cost the city more than $2 billion over 75 years.13 

Another example of how contracting out erodes public accountability is in the private prison industry. Private prisons 
account for about nine percent of prisons in the United States. To ensure high profit margins, 65 percent of private prison 
contracts with government entities set occupancy quotas or mandate payments for empty cells.14 It is also common for 
prison privatizers to sell inmate labor at subminimum wages to Fortune 500 companies to pad their bottom lines.15  To 
expand their business model, private prison corporations like CCA and the GEO Group have also funded the American 
Legislative Exchange Council (ALEC) to help enact legislation that has resulted in harsher prison sentences for offenders 
and expanded detention of immigrants.16  

Further Resources: 
In the Public Interest (www.itpi.org), Colorado Center for Policy Studies (www.uccs.edu/ccps)
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